

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR:

Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
(June 1, 2012 through May 31, 2013)

TIME &

DATE:

3:00 p.m., May 24, 2012

ITEM NO.

DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill Drive San Antonio, TX 78219	Act Pipe & Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233	Morrison Supply 5340 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247	Municipal Water Works 6959 Statech Hwy 276 Royse City, TX 75189
Group 1	Pipe Restraining System for PVC Bell & Spigot Joints						
1.	5 ea. (SAWS #15266) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	21.06 105.30	22.41 112.05	22.68 113.40	23.25 116.25	23.25 116.25
2.	70 ea. (SAWS #15262) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	29.22 2,045.40	29.45 2,061.50	28.78 2,014.60	29.07 2,034.90	29.37 2,055.90
3.	100 ea. (SAWS #15263) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	47.98 4,798.00	48.56 4,856.00	47.46 4,746.00	47.96 4,796.00	48.47 4,847.00
4.	5 ea. (SAWS #15260) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	79.37 396.85	84.49 422.45	85.58 427.90	87.72 438.60	87.72 438.60
5.	75 ea. (SAWS #15242) Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	89.08 6,681.00	92.44 6,933.00	92.18 6,913.50	93.63 7,022.25	94.61 7,095.75
6.	5 ea. (SAWS #15261) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	206.79 1,033.95	220.16 1,100.80	217.55 1,087.75	222.99 1,114.95	222.99 1,114.95
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #32427) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	350.68 1,753.40	373.35 1,866.75	378.15 1,890.75	387.61 1,938.05	408.44 2,042.20
8.	5 ea. (SAWS #15244) Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 24" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	410.23 2,051.15	436.75 2,183.75	431.59 2,157.95	442.38 2,211.90	763.16 3,815.80
	GROUP 1 TOTAL	TOTAL	18,865.05	19,536.30	19,351.85	19,672.90	21,526.45
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Sigma/Tyler/ Star	Sigma #PWP	Ford UFR1390	Ford UFR1390-C-I	Ford UFR139-C-I
Group 2	Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Bell & Spigot Joints	TOTAL					
1.	5 ea.(SAWS #30161) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 4" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	21.71 108.55	22.41 112.05	22.68 113.40	23.25 116.25	23.25 116.25
2.	25 ea. (SAWS #30162) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 6" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	28.53 713.25	29.45 736.25	28.76 719.00	29.07 726.75	29.37 734.25
3.	25 ea. (SAWS #30163) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 8" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	46.80 1,170.00	48.56 1,214.00	47.46 1,186.50	47.96 1,199.00	48.47 1,211.75
4.	5 ea. (SAWS #30164) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 10" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	81.84 409.20	84.49 422.45	85.58 427.90	87.72 438.60	87.72 438.60

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR:

Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
(June 1, 2012 through May 31, 2013)

TIME &

DATE:

3:00 p.m., May 24, 2012

ITEM NO.

DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill Drive San Antonio, TX 78219	Act Pipe & Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233	Morrison Supply 5340 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247	Municipal Water Works 6959 Statech Hwy 276 Royse City, TX 75189
5.	25 ea. (SAWS #30165) Restraint, Type Slip on Joint, Size 12" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	89.08 2,227.00	92.44 2,311.00	92.18 2,304.50	93.63 2,340.75	94.61 2,365.25
6.	5 ea. (SAWS #30166) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 16" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	213.23 1,066.15	220.16 1,100.80	393.84 1,969.20	222.99 1,114.95	403.69 2,018.45
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #32428) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 20" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	368.36 1,841.80	382.32 1,911.60	595.04 2,975.20	387.61 1,938.05	620.34 3,101.70
8.	5 ea. (SAWS #30168) Restraint, Type Joint, Size 24" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	477.06 2,385.30	495.13 2,475.65	744.54 3,722.70	442.38 2,211.90	763.16 3,815.80
	GROUP 2 TOTAL	TOTAL	9,921.25	10,283.80	13,418.40	10,086.25	13,802.05
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Sigma/Tyler/ Star	Sigma #PWP	Ford UFR1390/1490	Ford UFR1390-C-I	Ford UFR1390-C-I UFR 1490-D-I 16-24
GROUP 3	Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for PVC Pipe						
1.	5 ea. (SAWS #15265) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	16.33 81.65	17.38 86.90	18.73 93.65	25.98 129.90	19.33 96.65
2.	500 ea. (SAWS #15255) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20.65 10,325.00	21.10 10,550.00	24.54 12,270.00	31.45 15,725.00	25.20 12,600.00
3.	150 ea. (SAWS #15257) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	30.20 4,530.00	31.17 4,675.50	29.76 4,464.00	39.52 5,928.00	30.55 4,582.50
4.	10 ea. (SAWS #15246) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	55.28 552.80	58.91 589.10	54.31 543.10	71.74 717.40	56.26 562.60
5.	150 ea. (SAWS #15248) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	59.66 8,949.00	61.92 9,288.00	57.77 8,665.50	73.54 11,031.00	59.58 8,937.00
6.	10 ea. (SAWS #15250) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	126.39 1,263.90	132.53 1,325.30	123.56 1,235.60	147.84 1,478.40	127.47 1,274.70
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #30169) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	191.79 958.95	203.78 1,018.90	189.48 947.40	217.18 1,085.90	196.25 981.25
8.	10 ea. (SAWAS 15258) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	221.14 2,211.40	235.19 2,351.90	220.50 2,205.00	257.45 2,574.50	226.00 2,260.00
	GROUP 3 TOTAL	TOTAL	28,872.70	29,885.60	30,424.25	38,670.10	31,294.70
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Sigma/Tyler/ Star	Sigma #SLCE	Ford UFR1500	Ford UFR1500-CA-4-I UFR1500-CA-24-I	Ford UFR1500-I

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR:

Annual Contract for Joint Restraints

TIME &

(June 1, 2012 through May 31, 2013)

DATE:

3:00 p.m., May 24, 2012

ITEM NO.

DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill Drive San Antonio, TX 78219	Act Pipe & Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233	Morrison Supply 5340 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247	Municipal Water Works 6959 Statech Hwy 276 Royse City, TX 75189
GROUP 4	Mechanical Joint Wedge Action Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe						
1.	40 ea. (SAWS #15253) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 4" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	13.82 552.80	14.18 567.20	13.25 530.00	20.79 831.60	13.64 545.60
2.	150 ea. (SAWS #15254) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 6" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	16.08 2,412.00	16.68 2,502.00	15.61 2,341.50	24.95 3,742.50	16.05 2,407.50
3.	80 ea. (SAWS #15256) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 8" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	24.78 1,982.40	25.44 2,035.20	23.88 1,910.40	34.39 2,751.20	24.64 1,971.20
4.	5 ea. (SAWS #30172) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 10" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	36.66 183.30	37.65 188.25	35.53 177.65	48.45 242.25	36.45 182.25
5.	50 ea. (SAWS #15247) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 12" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53.30 2,665.00	54.74 2,737.00	50.87 2,543.50	65.66 3,283.00	52.57 2,628.50
6.	5 ea. (SAWS #15249) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 16" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	97.16 485.80	99.79 498.95	91.92 459.60	112.80 564.00	94.03 470.15
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #15251) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 20" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	170.69 853.45	175.33 876.65	159.71 798.55	187.70 938.50	163.70 818.50
8.	5 ea. (SAWS #15252) Restraint, Type Fitting Mechanical Joint, Size 24" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	235.79 1,178.95	243.45 1,217.25	206.13 1,030.65	247.75 1,238.75	211.29 1,056.45
	GROUP 4 TOTAL	TOTAL	10,313.70	10,622.50	9,791.85	13,591.80	10,080.15
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Sigma/Tyler/ Star	Sigma #SLDE	Ford UFR1400	Ford UFR1400-DA-4-I UFR1400-AA-24-I	Ford UFR1400-D-I
GROUP 5	Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for PVC Pipe to Mechanical Joint Fittings						
1.	20 ea. (SAWS #30174) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	43.00 860.00	NO BID	42.85 857.00	46.27 925.40	42.86 857.20
2.	20 ea. (SAWS #30175) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	61.00 1,220.00	NO BID	60.13 1,202.60	64.91 1,298.20	60.13 1,202.60
3.	15 ea. (SAWS #15259) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for PVC	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	111.00 1,665.00	NO BID	110.73 1,660.95	119.54 1,793.10	109.58 1,643.70
	GROUP 5 TOTAL	TOTAL	3,745.00	NO BID	3,720.55	4,016.70	3,703.50
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Sigma/Tyler Star	NO BID	Romac Grip Ring	Romac 6Grap-IPNCI	Romac GRAP-IP NCI

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
 TIME & (June 1, 2012 through May 31, 2013)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 24, 2012

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill Drive San Antonio, TX 78219	Act Pipe & Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233	Morrison Supply 5340 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247	Municipal Water Works 6959 Statech Hwy 276 Royse City, TX 75189
GROUP 6	Compression Ring Pipe Restraining System for Ductile Iron Pipe to Mechanical Joint Fittings						
1.	100 ea. (SAWS #30176) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 6" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	37.00 3,700.00	NO BID	35.91 3,591.00	38.77 3,877.00	35.90 3,590.00
2.	20 ea. (SAWS #30177) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 8" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	51.50 1,030.00	NO BID	51.18 1,023.60	55.25 1,105.00	51.15 1,023.00
3.	15 ea. (SAWS #30178) Restraint, Type Grip Ring, Size 12" used for DI	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	101.00 1,515.00	NO BID	100.18 1,502.70	108.15 1,622.25	100.15 1,502.25
	GROUP 6 TOTAL	TOTAL	6,245.00	NO BID	6,117.30	6,604.25	6,115.25
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Romac	NO BID	Romac Grip Ring	Romac 6 Grap-DI NCI	Romac GRAP-DI-NCI
GROUP 7	Accessory Sets						
1.	150 ea. (SAWS #9062) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 4", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	9.43 1,414.50	9.88 1,482.00	10.06 1,509.00	9.73 1,459.50	11.95 1,792.50
2.	1,000 ea. (SAWS #9063) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 6", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	13.26 13,260.00	13.48 13,480.00	13.85 13,850.00	12.98 12,980.00	16.27 16,270.00
3.	400 ea. (SAWS #9064) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 8", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	14.93 5,972.00	15.27 6,108.00	15.61 6,244.00	15.20 6,080.00	18.45 7,380.00
4.	50 ea. (SAWS #9058) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 10", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	21.05 1,052.50	22.02 1,101.00	22.41 1,120.50	21.90 1,095.00	26.54 1,327.00
5.	150 ea. (SAWS #9059) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 12", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	22.39 3,358.50	22.91 3,436.50	23.42 3,513.00	22.32 3,348.00	27.64 4,146.00
6.	50 ea. (SAWS #9060) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 16", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	36.08 1,804.00	37.74 1,887.00	38.41 1,920.50	37.54 1,877.00	45.52 2,276.00
7.	5 ea. (SAWS #15891) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 20", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	67.43 337.15	70.55 352.75	71.80 359.00	70.15 350.75	85.08 425.40
8.	5 ea. (SAWS #9061) Accessory Set, Type MJ, Size 24", includes T-Bolts, Nuts, Glands and Gaskets	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	94.48 472.40	98.86 494.30	100.61 503.05	98.30 491.50	119.21 596.05
	GROUP 7 TOTAL	TOTAL	27,671.05	28,341.55	29,019.05	27,681.75	34,212.95
	Manufacturer Brand and Part Number	Mfr Brand Part No.	Sigma Proselect	Sigma #DGP Accs	Star Pipe Products	Sigma DGP4-DGP24	Tyler, SIP, Sigma

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL FOR: Annual Contract for Joint Restraints
 TIME & DATE: (June 1, 2012 through May 31, 2013)
 3:00 p.m., May 24, 2012

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	Ferguson Waterworks 4427 Factory Hill Drive San Antonio, TX 78219	Act Pipe & Supply 4719 Dodge Street San Antonio, TX 78217	HD Supply Waterworks, Ltd. 13790 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX 78233	Morrison Supply 5340 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247	Municipal Water Works 6959 Statech Hwy 276 Royse City, TX 75189
	EXTENSION 1	85,330.50				
	EXTENSION 2	85,330.50				
	EXTENSION 3	85,330.50				
	Terms	Net 30 days	2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days
	Delivery Days	2 weeks	15 days	7-10 days	10 days	14-21 days

***DENOTES LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Act Pipe & Supply
 Cascade Water Works
 Ferguson Waterworks
 HD Supply Waterworks
 Morrison Supply Co.
 Municipal Water Works Supply
 PMI Steel Pipe
 William Supply Co.

Demandstar
 SAWS Website